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frequency to larger values. This has eliminated the need to 
clean off ash deposits except at semi-annual periodic 
inspections. Cleaning off ash deposits at periodic inspections 
requires a shutdown and takes a lot of labor, but is considered 
as an important item necessary not to lower the operating 
rate. Regarding this point, we are studying if there is any 
measure better than the current one.

Measures for NOx emissions
On the island of Kyushu in Japan, a large part of the power 
demand is covered by the output of solar power generation. 
Therefore, in spring and fall, when the power demand is low, 
renewable energies may be subject to curtailment. CFB 
boilers have slow combustion at low temperatures of 800 to 
900°C. Therefore, compared with conventional burner 
combustion boilers, CFB boilers emit less thermal NOx, 
which is produced when nitrogen and oxygen in the 
combustion air react at high temperatures. However, when 
the output is low, CFB boilers are operated with an excessive 
amount of air relative to the amount of fuel fed, and therefore, 
emit less NOx when the boiler load is low than when it is 
high. In addition, biomass fuel, which contains less fixed 
carbon than coal, reacts less to reduce NOx to N2 with 
unburned char. Therefore, CFB boilers are likely to emit 
more NOx when used with biomass fuel.

The NOx




